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CPRaE Ministry of Higher Education
- Assiut University
——— Faculty of Science

Final Exam
Term II, Year: 2015/2016
Second Year
Course Title: English Language (2)
Date of Exam: Wednesday 15/6/2016
Time Allotted: 120 Minutes

Answer the following questions:

Part I: Read the following passage Carefully, then answer the Questions below.
(20 points)

Thomas Edison was born February 11, 1847 in Milan, Ohio. He was

nicknamed "Al" at an early age. At age 11, Edison moved to Michigan where he
spent the remainder of his childhood.
Thomas Edison struggled at school, but learned to love reading and conducting
experiments from his mother who taught him at home. At age 15, Edison became a
"tramp telegrapher’, sending and receiving messages via morse code, an
electronically-conveyed alphabet using different clicks for each letter. Eventually,
he worked for the Union Army as a telegrapher. Edison often entertained himself
by taking things apart to see how they worked. Soon, he decided to become an
inventor.

In 1870, Edison moved to New York City and improved the stock ticker. He
soon formed his own company that manufactured the new stock tickers. He also
began working on the telegraph, and invented a version that could send four
messages at once. Meanwhile, Edison married Mary Stillwell, had three children
“and moved his family to Menlo Park, New Jersey where he started his famous
laboratory.

In 1877, Edison, with help from "muckers", individuals from around the
world looking to make fortunes in America, invented the phonograph. The
phonograph was a machine that recorded and played back sounds. He perfected the
phonograph by recording "Mary had a Little Lamb" on a piece of tin foil! In 1878,
Idison invented the light bulb as well as the power grid system, which could
generate electricity and deliver it to homes through a network of wires. He
subsequently started the Edison Electric Light Company in October of 1878.

In 1884, after he attained great fame and fortune, Mary Stillwell died: Edison
remarried 20 year-old Mina Miller in 1886. He had three more children and moved
to West Orange, New Jersey. At West Orange, Edison built one of the largest
laboratories in the world. He worked extremely hard and registered 1,093 patents.
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Edison continued to invent or improve products and make significant contributions
to x-ray technology, storage batteries and motion pictures (movies). He also
invented the world's first talking doll. His inventions changed the world forever.
They still influence the way we live today. Edison worked until his death on
October 18, 1931.

Questions:

1

In what state did Thomas Edison NOT live?
a. Michigan

b. Ohio

¢. Massachusetts

How many children did Thomas Edison have?
. ;3
B3
c. 6

What best describes Morse Code?

a. A language for deaf people

b. A system of clicks that stand for letters
c. A system of clicks that stand for words

What was one of Thomas Edison's first accomplishments?
a. Inventing an improved stock ticker

b. Inventing an improved x-ray

c. Inventing tin foil

A phonograph is most similar to:
a. A walkie-talkie

b. A record player

c. A television

What is a "mucker"?

a. Someone from another country

b. Someone from another country hoping to find a home in America

c. Someone from another country hoping to make a fortune in America

Select all of the following that Thomas Edison did not invent.
a. The first storage battery

b. A power system that could deliver electricity to homes

c. The first stock ticker

What does the quote “Genius is 1 percent inspiration and 99 percent
perspiration” mean?
a. Only geniuses should think of new ideas
b. Geniuses have to sweat a lot to come up with good ideas.
c. Great ideas take more hard work than ingenuity
Page 2 of 4
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Assiut University
Faculty of Science
Second Semester Final Examination

AR (June 2016)
Subject: English Language I Code: 015UR
Students: Level One Time Allowed: 2 hours
I- Identify the topic sentence in the following paragraph: (4 marks)

Some people leave too many lights on around the house. Some aren’t careful

about how much water they use. Americans waste a lot of resources. Most people buy

products with a lot of unnecessary packaging that isn’t good for the environment.

[1- Find out the irrelevant sentence in the following paragraph: (4 marks)

Mr. Phillips is the principal of Lake Ridge School. He makes announcements
cvery morning at 8:15 to greet all students and to get the day started. Every morning
hc makes a quick visit to all the classes and usually waves to the students. Mr.
Phillips also walks around in the cafeteria to make sure students are safe. He likes to
cat tacos. He also directs traffic on the cross walk at the end of each day.

[11- Read the following passage then answer the questions below: (18 Marks)

When you imagine the desert, you probably think of a very hot place covered
with sand. Although this is a good description for many deserts, Earth’s largest desert
is actually a very cold place covered with ice: Antarctica.

In order for an area to be considered a desert, it must receive very little rainfall.
More specifically, it must receive an average of less than ten inches of
precipitation--which can be rain, sleet, hail, or snow-—on the ground every year.
Antarctica, the coldest place on earth, has an average temperature that usually falls
below the freezing point. And because cold air holds less moisture than warm air, the
air in Antarctica does not hold much moisture at all. This is evident in the low
precipitation statistics recorded for Antarctica. For example, the central part of
Antarctica receives an average of less than 2 inches of snow every year. The coastline
ol" Antarctica receives a’ little bit more-—between seven and eight inches a year.
Bccause Antarctica gets so little precipitation every year, it is considered a desert.

When precipitation falls in hot deserts, it quickly evaporates back into the
atmosphere. The air over Antarctica is too cold to hold water vapor, so there is very
little evaporation. Due to this low rate of evaporation, most of the snow that falls to
the ground remains there permanently, eventually building up into thick ice sheets.
Any snow that does not freeze into ice sheets becomes caught up in the strong winds
that constantly blow over-Antarctica. These snow-filled winds can make it look as if
it is snowing. Even though snowfall is very rare there, blizzards are actually very
common on Antarctica. ‘
1) The main purpose of paragraph 1 is to
A. accept a conclusion B. introduce an argument
C. provide a brief history « D. deny a common belief

(Go to the back of this sheet)
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(Page Two)
2) The best title for this passage would be
A. Larth’s Many Deserts B. Antarctica: The Coldest Place on Earth
C. A Desert of [ce D. Unusual Blizzards

3) Africa’s Sahara Desert is the second-largest desert on earth. Based on the
information in the passage, what characteristic must the Sahara share with
Antarctica?

A. low temperatures B. high temperatures

C. frequent blizzards D. low precipitation

4) As used in paragraph 2, which is the best definition for preeipitation?

A. moisture in the air that falls to the ground

B. any type of weather event

(. weather events that only happen in very cold areas

D. a blizzard that occurs in areas with limited snowfall

5) In paragraph 2 the author writes, ""And because cold air holds less moisture
than warm air, the air in Antarctica does not hold much moisture at all." Using
this information, it can be understood that

A. air in Africa holds more moisture than the air in Antarctica

13. air surrounding a tropical island holds less moisture than the air in Antarctica

C. air in the second floor of a house is typically warmer than air on the first floor

D. air at the mountains is typically colder than the air at the beach

6) Based on the information in the final paragraph, it can be understood that
blizzards in Antarctica are mainly the result of

A. freezing cold temperatures B. large amounts of snowfall
C. low amounts of precipitation D. strong winds
V- Correct the following sentences: ' ' (24 Marks)

1) Each of the girls sing well.
2) Fifty percent of the pie have disappeared.

3) Ten dollars are a high price to pay.

4) Neither she nor they was willing to predict the election.

5) Pleasc give it to John or myself.

6) Whoever you elect will serve a four-year term.

7) Some of the pies is missing.

8) You should check your spelling, grammar, and punctuating.

9) The order was requested six weeks ago, therefore I expected the shipment to
arrive by now.

10) T must study english and math.

11) The folder, not the letters, were misplaced.

12) He is not unwilling to help.

(Best Wishes)
Examiners:

Dr. Sherin Abdel Ghaffar
Dr. Yasser Ahmed Gomaa
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SNy Final Exam for Level 1
Wié ' Subject: Computer Science MC100 -
e Time: 2 Hours
2.aTerm 2015/2016 :
Date: June, 13, 2016 @

Mathematics Dept.

_-Faculty of Science

Assiut University.

Answer the Following Questions: (50 marks)

[ Q1.

Choose the correct answer :

value is referenced by A(2:3,end)?
a) [27]

b) [6 2]

¢) [13]

dy [421

2) Letx=[00 1 1]. Which command creates a vector X

a) x=0:1

b) x=[zeros(1,2) ones(1,2)]
¢) x=onestzeros

d) x=[zeros(1,2) ; ones(1,2)]

and 75.
a)31,2,75
b) linspace(31,75,2)

¢) linspace(31,75,23)
d) 31:3:75

numbers?

1) Given the matrix input in Matlab A =[157;2 6 4; 3 8 2], which

3) Which one creates a vector of the odd whole numbers between 31

4) Which Matlab command is usually used to generate random

a) mod b) for ¢ ) rand dyexp

=[3268]andy=[4135]. What is the result of min([x;y])

(10 marks?

1/4



Q2.

2.1 Find and Correct the errors in the following MATLAB codes

@

| a) b)

| function fac=ff(s) x=rand(2,2)
fac=1; y=ones(2,1)
for i =50:1 =x*y
fac=fac*b; cle(x)
i=i-1
end

2.2 Write a MATLAB function that computes the summation of 15
elements of the matrix X where

X =0, X@) =1, X@) = X(i-1D+X(G—2), i=34,..,15

(15 marks)

2/4




Q3.

£}
\J
Write an algorithm and draw a flowehart to print the square of all

numbers from LOW to HIGH. Test with LOW=50 and HIGH=100.

(10 marks)

3/4




Q4.

4.1 Write the output of the following M-file

a) b)
s=[52 7] x=5;
while(x==5) -

for i=1:length(s) d=x"2;

k=length(s)+1; X=x/5;
y(k-i)=s(i); end

end disp(x)

disp(y) disp(d)

4.2  Write a MATLAB function to compute the roots of
quadratic equation
ax*+bx+c=0

(15 marks)

Best Wishes
4/4
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Answer the following questions
First: The integration: ( 25 mark)
(1)Find the following integrals:
e 5 6 X X ~2
(a) |sin’x cos’xdx , (b)]e cosxdx , (c) dx
2
Jx? +4x +5

2 2
(2) Find the area bounded by : V=X and y=8-Xx".
(3)Find the volume of cone-based with height is L and radius of its base is R.

T dx
(4) Show if the integral: 14+ x? is convergence or divergence?

Second: Analytic geometry: ( 25 mark)

(1) Write the following equation in the polar form : X+ } = \/i
(2) Determine the equation of the circle with the center (2, 3) and tangent to

the line 3x+4y+7=0.

(3) Find the equation of the parabola with directrix 245 x + 4y 120
and its focus (2,3).

i 3 : s 5 )
(4)Find and discuss an equation for the ellipse with eccentricity o vertices
V<O> i6) and sketch the graph.
(5) Find and discuss an equation for the hyperbola with foci F(O, i5) , length
of conjugate axis 4 and sketch the graph.
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Assiut University
Faculty of Science
Department of Mathematics

Final Examination in Computer (MC100)
First-level 2016
Time: 2 hours Total Mark:50

Answer each of the following questions:
Question 1: Choose the correct answer: [15 Marks]

1.  Which statement below will resuit in the variable y containing [71 3 5 7]?
a) y=linspace(1,7,4)

b) . y=147
¢c) y=linspace(1,4,7)
d) y=174

2. Given a matrix A, which Matlab command uses to find the summation value of each row in A?
A=[29 39 40; 43 23 10]
a) sum(A, 2)
by sum(A,[1 1)
¢y sum(A,1)
d) sum(A, 1, 2)
3. Which of the following is not an acceptable name for a Matlab variable?

a) Index2
b) Index?2
c) Index_2
d) In2dex
4. Which one is not an arithmetical operator in MATLAB?
a)\
b) /
Q) ++
d) .-+

5. Given that A=[1 2 1 3] and B=[1 3 4 2]. Which statement below will result in the
variable C containing [1 6 4 6]?
a) A*B
b) A.*B
) A*.B
d) None of the above
6. Which Matlab command gives you the name of all variables defined in the workspace?
a) what
b) who
c) which
d) whom
7. Given the matrices A and B, which matrix operation is not aliowed by Matlab?
A=[131,250]
B=[115895]
a) A*B
by A*B
c) A+B
d A-B
8. Which Matlab command allows you to delete all variables in the workspace?
a) Delete
b) Clear
c) Clean
d) Clc )
9. Given a matrix A, which Matlab command uses to find the maximum value of each row in A?
A=[29 39 40; 43 23 10]
a) Max(A[]2) .
b) Max(A[L1)
c) Max(A,1)
d) Max(A,2)
10. which Matlab command uses to open a figure window and make it the current figure
a) window
b) clf
¢) create figure
d) figure

Page1of3
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11. Which one is not a relational operator in MATLAB?
a) = R
bY~=
o>

d)<
12. Which of the following determines the number of elements N of the matrix B = [1
234125717
a) N = size(B)
b) N = elem(B)
c) N = length(B)
d) N = numel(B)
13. Which Matlab command aliows you to generate 3x5 random values in the range [0 1]?
a) rand(3.5)
b) ran(5,3)
¢) random(3,5)
d) round(3,5)
14. Which of the following is not an acceptable name for a Matlab variable?
a) function [output] = function_name(inputs)
by Joutput] function = function_name(inputs)
¢) function_name [ouiput] = function{inputs)
d) [output] function_name = function(inputs)
15. Given that x = [1 2], y = [4 5], and z=[ 0 0]. What is the value of A=[x y]

a 1 2 45
b. 12
45
c. 54 21
d 45
12

Question 2: Examine and choose the correct answer: [10 Marks]
1. Whatis the value of B at the end of the program:

A=2;
forii=0:2:4
A=[A, A%iif;
end
B=A
a.B= 2,000 -
bh.B= 2
20
200
2000

¢.B=204080160
d.B=2248
2. What is the value of M at the end of the program:
A=[12 24 50 7 89 5j;

M=A(1);
for i=2:length(A)
if (M < Ali))
M=Afi);
end
end
a. 5
b. 89 =
c. 12
d. 50
3.  What is the output of the following code:

X=[15 0 0 0 45];
I= Find(X,2, first’);
disp(X(i))
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b, X{i)=
15 4
c. 1 5
d 4 5
What is the output of the following code:
v=[3721];
for i =1:length(v)
v(i) = v(i) * 3;
end
14
a V=
9 21 6 4
b V=
9 21 6 3
V=
3216 3
9 21 6 3

What is the output of the following code:

vec =11 -5 33
vec(ver <) = []

E

2 8 -4 25

avec =
134 5
1. vec
11 .5 33 28 -4 25
C. vec
d. vec

17033 2 8 25

Question 3: True/Faise: [25 Marks]

1. Suppose that the two column vectors of a and b are of the same size. The following
command will produce an error in MATLAB: a."b

2. In Matiab, Addition and subtraction have the same precedence.

3. The Matiab command “type” is used to show the content of a script file

4. The Matlab operator “;” can be used within “[ ]” to define new column

5. in plot{x,y) Matlab command, when x and y are two vectors, they must have the same number
of elements

6. in Matlab, Multiplication and division have the same precedence.

7. The Matlab command “whos” gives some information about all the variables defined in the
workspace

8. In Matlab, we should use the operator “*.” In order to perform the multiplication element by
element

9. Given that x = [1 2], y = [4 5], and z=[ 0 0], it is accepted to write the following command A=[x
y; ]

10. To execute a script file “search.m” in the Matlab command prompt, you can type
>>search.m

11. The following variable name is accepted in Matlab V1_12

12. Matlab is an Interpreter

13. The errors are easy to fix when using a compiler instead of interpreter

14. Compiler is usually faster than interpreter

15. Matlab is Software package

16. MATLAB is not a general purpose programming language such as C/C++.

17. MATLAB is an interpreted language, slower than a compiled language such as C++.

18. MATLAB commands are specific for MATLAB usage. Most of them do not have a direct
equivalent with other programming language commands.

19. MATLAB is not free. )

20. MATLAB may behave as a calculator or as a programming language

21. MATLAB combine nicely calculation and graphic plotting.

22. MATLAB is relatively easy to learn

23. MATLAB is optimized to be relatively fast when performing matrix operations

24. The percent sign “%” is used for Matlab comments

25. The semi-colon *;” will suppress the output of a Matlab command

Good Luck Dr. Mohammed M. Abdelsamea
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