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1-Species composition of
arthropod pests and natural
enemy species inhabiting cowpea
plantations: Data revealed the
presence of 24 arthropod species
belonging to 16 families and 7
orders in association with cowpea
plantations. The collected species
can be divided into 5 groups. All
the collected species were captured
by the sweeping net method. Five
of these species were captured by
leaves direct count method, while 2
species were captured by pods
direct count method.
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The aims of the present
investigation were study the
morphology of some terrestrial
spiders of Assiut governorate,
Egypt with the special reference to
sense organs and using Light and
stereo-scanning electron
microscopy to identify different
types of sense organs distributed
on different parts of the studied
spiders which include eyes,
sensilla, hairs, seta and scales.
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